
Phone                                                   

800-282-3655

Phone                                                    

321-783-9000

Phone                                                    

407-363-3939

ITEMS Location Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3

1 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 38 Passenger Bus 3,235.00$              3,364.40$     3,498.98$  3,638.94$    1,500.00$           1,500.00$     1,500.00$       1,500.00$       2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

2 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 47/50 Passenger Bus 3,235.00$              3,364.40$     3,498.98$  3,638.94$    -$               -$                 -$                 2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

3 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,235.00$              3,364.40$     3,498.98$  3,638.94$    1,600.00$           1,600.00$     1,600.00$       1,600.00$       2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

4 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,235.00$              3,364.40$     3,498.98$  3,638.94$    -$               -$                 -$                 2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

5 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

6 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

7 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

8 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

9 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

10 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

11 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

12 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 529.00$                 550.16$        572.17$     595.05$       -$               -$                 -$                 300.00$               315.00$               330.75$          347.29$       

13 Mileage Rate per mile over 250 miles 9.53$                      9.91$             10.31$        10.72$          -$               -$                 -$                 9.50$                   9.98$                    10.47$             11.00$          

14 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 38 Passenger Bus 3,588.00$              3,731.52$     3,880.78$  4,036.01$    2,200.00$           2,200.00$     2,200.00$       2,200.00$       2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

15 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 47/50 Passenger Bus 3,588.00$              3,731.52$     3,880.78$  4,036.01$    -$               -$                 -$                 2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

16 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,588.00$              3,731.52$     3,880.78$  4,036.01$    2,300.00$           2,300.00$     2,300.00$       2,300.00$       2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

17 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,588.00$              3,731.52$     3,880.78$  4,036.01$    -$               -$                 -$                 2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

18 Premium Rate Per Hour 674.00$                 700.96$        729.00$     758.16$       150.00$               150.00$        150.00$           150.00$           400.00$               420.00$               441.00$          463.05$       

19 Premium Rate Flat Rate 6,557.00$              6,819.28$     7,092.05$  7,375.73$    5,000.00$           5,000.00$     5,000.00$       5,000.00$       5,000.00$           5,250.00$            5,512.50$       5,788.13$    

20 Cancellation Fee (only applicable if canceled less than 72 hours) 100.00$                 104.00$        108.16$     112.49$       1,500.00$           1,500.00$     1,500.00$       1,500.00$       FULL FULL FULL FULL

21 Relief Driver 5,684.00$              5,911.36$     6,147.81$  6,393.73$    -$               -$                 -$                 900.00$               945.00$               992.25$          1,041.86$    

TOTAL (INCLUDING RENEWALS)

Renewal Rates - 4% 4% 4% - 0% 0% 0% 0% 5% 5% 5%

Federal Motor Carrier #/DOT # 223283 3077114 682703

NOTES

Phone                                                    

407-888-2624

Phone                                                    

407-418-1222

Phone                                                    

954-800-8693

ITEMS Location Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3

1 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 38 Passenger Bus 2,250.00$              2,407.50$     2,576.03$  2,756.35$    1,200.00$           1,320.00$     1,452.00$       1,597.20$       1,195.00$           1,314.50$            1,445.95$       1,590.55$    

2 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 47/50 Passenger Bus 2,250.00$              2,407.50$     2,576.03$  2,756.35$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,270.00$           1,397.00$            1,536.70$       1,690.37$    

3 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 2,250.00$              2,407.50$     2,576.03$  2,756.35$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,270.00$           1,397.00$            1,536.70$       1,690.37$    

4 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 2,250.00$              2,407.50$     2,576.03$  2,756.35$    1,300.00$           1,430.00$     1,573.00$       1,730.30$       1,270.00$           1,397.00$            1,536.70$       1,690.37$    

5 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       160.00$               176.00$        193.60$           212.96$           150.00$               165.00$               181.50$          199.65$       

6 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

7 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

8 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       180.00$               198.00$        217.80$           239.58$           165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

9 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       190.00$               209.00$        229.90$           252.89$           150.00$               165.00$               181.50$          199.65$       

10 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

11 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

12 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 400.00$                 428.00$        457.96$     490.02$       210.00$               231.00$        254.10$           279.51$           165.00$               181.50$               199.65$          219.62$       

13 Mileage Rate per mile over 250 miles 12.00$                   12.84$           13.74$        14.70$          10.00$                 11.00$           12.10$             13.31$             7.00$                   7.70$                    8.47$               9.32$            

14 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 38 Passenger Bus 4,500.00$              4,815.00$     5,152.05$  5,512.69$    1,800.00$           1,980.00$     2,178.00$       2,395.80$       1,700.00$           1,870.00$            2,057.00$       2,262.70$    

15 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 47/50 Passenger Bus 4,500.00$              4,815.00$     5,152.05$  5,512.69$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,800.00$           1,980.00$            2,178.00$       2,395.80$    

16 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 4,500.00$              4,815.00$     5,152.05$  5,512.69$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,800.00$           1,980.00$            2,178.00$       2,395.80$    

17 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 4,500.00$              4,815.00$     5,152.05$  5,512.69$    2,000.00$           2,200.00$     2,420.00$       2,662.00$       1,800.00$           1,980.00$            2,178.00$       2,395.80$    

18 Premium Rate Per Hour 750.00$                 802.50$        858.68$     918.78$       305.00$               335.50$        369.05$           405.96$           300.00$               330.00$               363.00$          399.30$       

19 Premium Rate Flat Rate 7,500.00$              8,025.00$     8,586.75$  9,187.82$    4,000.00$           4,400.00$     4,840.00$       5,324.00$       4,200.00$           4,620.00$            5,082.00$       5,590.20$    

20 Cancellation Fee (only applicable if canceled less than 72 hours) 100% 100% 100% 100% 500.00$               550.00$        605.00$           665.50$           250.00$               275.00$               302.50$          332.75$       

21 Relief Driver 7,500.00$              8,025.00$     8,586.75$  9,187.82$    1,500.00$           1,650.00$     1,815.00$       1,996.50$       1,800.00$           1,980.00$            2,178.00$       2,395.80$    

TOTAL (INCLUDING RENEWALS)

Renewal Rates - 7% 7% 7% - 10% 10% 10% - 10% 10% 10%

Federal Motor Carrier #/DOT # 1444598 535893 3261609

Date Opened: 2/13/2025

No. of Vendors Notified: 117

No. of Vendors Responded: 12

Email

info@escotbuslines.com

Email

sales@exoticcoachlines.com

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

6805 West Commercial Blvd, Suite 302, Ft Lauderdale, FL 33319

Email

sales@empirecoachline.com

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

1161 Spruce Ave, Orlando, FL 32824

Tabulation    - Solicitation Number and Title:   ITB 25-11 Charter Bus Services

Vendor:    Dynamic Tours and Transportation

Email

edakkak@dynamicbuslines.com

Vendor:    BTM Coach, Inc.

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

400 West Landstreet Road, Orlando, FL 32824

Vendor:    Empire Coach Line, Inc. Vendor:    Escot Bus Lines, LLC

Vendor:    Florida Trails, Inc. d/b/a Annett Bus Lines

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

130 Madrid Drive, Sebring, FL 33876

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

1445 Cox Road, Cocoa Florida 32926

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

10360 General Drive, Orlando, FL 32824

Email

sales@annettbuslines.com

Email

jamesbo@btmcoach.com

Vendor:    Exotic Coach Lines

Vendor:    Motorcoach Class A Transportation, Inc. d/b/a MCA 

Transportation
Vendor:    Miami Coach and Tours, LLCVendor:    Jet Set Line, Inc.



Phone                                                    

407-649-6599

Phone                                                    

305-799-7096

Phone                                                    

407-226-2256

ITEMS Location Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3

1 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 38 Passenger Bus 1,950.00$              2,047.50$     2,149.88$  2,257.37$    1,400.00$           1,442.00$     1,485.26$       1,529.82$       2,600.00$           2,730.00$            2,866.50$       3,009.83$    

2 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 47/50 Passenger Bus 1,950.00$              2,047.50$     2,149.88$  2,257.37$    1,450.00$           1,493.50$     1,538.31$       1,584.45$       2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

3 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 1,950.00$              2,047.50$     2,149.88$  2,257.37$    1,600.00$           1,648.00$     1,697.44$       1,748.36$       2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

4 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 1,950.00$              2,047.50$     2,149.88$  2,257.37$    1,650.00$           1,699.50$     1,750.49$       1,803.00$       2,900.00$           3,045.00$            3,197.25$       3,357.11$    

5 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       145.00$               149.35$        153.83$           158.45$           200.00$               210.00$               220.50$          231.53$       

6 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       155.00$               159.65$        164.44$           169.37$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

7 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       165.00$               169.95$        175.05$           180.30$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

8 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       170.00$               175.10$        180.35$           185.76$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

9 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       135.00$               139.05$        143.22$           147.52$           200.00$               210.00$               220.50$          231.53$       

10 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       145.00$               149.35$        153.83$           158.45$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

11 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       155.00$               159.65$        164.44$           169.37$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

12 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 550.00$                 577.50$        606.38$     636.69$       160.00$               164.80$        169.74$           174.84$           250.00$               262.50$               275.63$          289.41$       

13 Mileage Rate per mile over 250 miles 15.00$                   15.75$           16.54$        17.36$          6.00$                   6.18$             6.37$               6.56$               12.00$                 12.60$                 13.23$             13.89$          

14 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 38 Passenger Bus 5,000.00$              5,250.00$     5,512.50$  5,788.13$    1,750.00$           1,802.50$     1,856.58$       1,912.27$       2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

15 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 47/50 Passenger Bus 5,000.00$              5,250.00$     5,512.50$  5,788.13$    1,800.00$           1,854.00$     1,909.62$       1,966.91$       2,500.00$           2,625.00$            2,756.25$       2,894.06$    

16 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 5,000.00$              5,250.00$     5,512.50$  5,788.13$    1,900.00$           1,957.00$     2,015.71$       2,076.18$       2,500.00$           2,625.00$            2,756.25$       2,894.06$    

17 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 5,000.00$              5,250.00$     5,512.50$  5,788.13$    1,950.00$           2,008.50$     2,068.76$       2,130.82$       2,500.00$           2,625.00$            2,756.25$       2,894.06$    

18 Premium Rate Per Hour 700.00$                 735.00$        771.75$     810.34$       350.00$               360.50$        371.32$           382.45$           1,000.00$           1,050.00$            1,102.50$       1,157.63$    

19 Premium Rate Flat Rate 6,000.00$              6,300.00$     6,615.00$  6,945.75$    4,750.00$           4,892.50$     5,039.28$       5,190.45$       4,000.00$           4,200.00$            4,410.00$       4,630.50$    

20 Cancellation Fee (only applicable if canceled less than 72 hours) 25-100% 25-100% 25-100% 25-100% 20% 20% 20% 20% 500.00$               20% 20% 20%

21 Relief Driver 1,000.00$              1,050.00$     1,102.50$  1,157.63$    550.00$               566.50$        583.50$           601.00$           2,000.00$           2,100.00$            2,205.00$       2,315.25$    

TOTAL (INCLUDING RENEWALS)

Renewal Rates 5% 5% 5% 3% 3% 3% 5% 5% 5%

Federal Motor Carrier #/DOT # 478281 1309244 1249279

Phone                                                    

407-574-7662

Phone                                                    

877-777-0045

Phone                                                    

305-731-2234

ITEMS Location Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3 Price Option Yr 1 Option Yr 2 Option Yr 3

1 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 38 Passenger Bus 3,000.00$              3,450.00$     3,967.50$  4,562.63$    2,500.00$           2,750.00$     3,025.00$       3,327.50$       850.00$               875.50$               901.77$          928.82$       

2 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 47/50 Passenger Bus 3,000.00$              3,450.00$     3,967.50$  4,562.63$    2,500.00$           2,750.00$     3,025.00$       3,327.50$       850.00$               875.50$               901.77$          928.82$       

3 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,000.00$              3,450.00$     3,967.50$  4,562.63$    2,500.00$           2,750.00$     3,025.00$       3,327.50$       850.00$               875.50$               901.77$          928.82$       

4 Flat Rate for first 4 hours (minimum) of bus service. - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,000.00$              3,450.00$     3,967.50$  4,562.63$    2,500.00$           2,750.00$     3,025.00$       3,327.50$       850.00$               875.50$               901.77$          928.82$       

5 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

6 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

7 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

8 Rate Per Hour (over 4 hours, less than 10 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

9 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 38 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

10 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 47/50 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

11 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

12 Rate Per Hour (over 10 hours, less than 15 hours). - 51/55 Passenger Bus 450.00$                 517.50$        595.13$     684.39$       550.00$               605.00$        665.50$           732.05$           140.00$               144.20$               148.53$          152.98$       

13 Mileage Rate per mile over 250 miles 8.00$                      9.20$             10.58$        12.17$          7.50$                   8.25$             9.08$               9.98$               5.00$                   5.15$                    5.30$               5.46$            

14 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 38 Passenger Bus 3,500.00$              4,025.00$     4,628.75$  5,323.06$    3,500.00$           3,850.00$     4,235.00$       4,658.50$       1,450.00$           1,493.50$            1,538.31$       1,584.45$    

15 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 47/50 Passenger Bus 3,500.00$              4,025.00$     4,628.75$  5,323.06$    3,500.00$           3,850.00$     4,235.00$       4,658.50$       1,450.00$           1,493.50$            1,538.31$       1,584.45$    

16 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,500.00$              4,025.00$     4,628.75$  5,323.06$    3,500.00$           3,850.00$     4,235.00$       4,658.50$       1,450.00$           1,493.50$            1,538.31$       1,584.45$    

17 Daily Rate - Multiple Night Trip - 51/55 Passenger Bus 3,500.00$              4,025.00$     4,628.75$  5,323.06$    3,500.00$           3,850.00$     4,235.00$       4,658.50$       1,450.00$           1,493.50$            1,538.31$       1,584.45$    

18 Premium Rate Per Hour 750.00$                 862.50$        991.88$     1,140.66$    700.00$               770.00$        847.00$           931.70$           No BID No BID No BID No BID

19 Premium Rate Flat Rate 7,500.00$              8,625.00$     9,918.75$  11,406.56$  6,000.00$           6,600.00$     7,260.00$       7,986.00$       3,150.00$           3,244.50$            3,341.84$       3,442.09$    

20 Cancellation Fee (only applicable if canceled less than 72 hours) 200.00$                 230.00$        264.50$     304.18$       100.00$               110.00$        121.00$           133.10$           No BID No BID No BID No BID

21 Relief Driver 4,500.00$              5,175.00$     5,951.25$  6,843.94$    3,500.00$           3,850.00$     4,235.00$       4,658.50$       550.00$               566.50$               583.50$          601.00$       

TOTAL (INCLUDING RENEWALS)

Renewal Rates - 15% 15% 15% 10% 10% 10% - 3% 3% 3%

Federal Motor Carrier #/DOT # 1882749 3114569 1729770

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in s. 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.  (Note: Florida 

Other Information: Award Recommendation - This is a notice of the District's intent to award.   The recommendation is to award  to all responsive and responsible vendors.

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

PO Box 618097, Orlando, FL32861

Email

sales@mcatransportation.com

Email

MiamiCoachTours@gmail.com

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

PO Boc 41462, Miami Beach, FL 33141

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

3718 LB McLeod Road, Orlando, FL 32805

Email

sales@jetsetusa.com

Email

Contact@phoenixbusorlando.com

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

3220 37th Street, Orlando, FL 32839

Vendor:    Phoenix Bus Inc Vendor:    PICO BROS Company

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

428 Ring Road, Orlando, FL 32811

Email

sales@picobros.com

Vendor:    Southern Bus Lines

Contact Name and Address                                                                             

8601 Southwest 129th Terrace, Miami, FL 33156

Email


